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Fifteen-year-old Will Drake has made a career of breaking out from high-security prisons. His talents have
landed him at the Rig, a special juvenile holding facility in the middle of the Arctic Ocean. No one can
escape from the Rig. After hatching some escape plans—and making the first real friends of his life—Drake
quickly realizes that all is not as it seems on the Rig. The warden is obsessed with the mysterious Crystal-X,
a blue glowing substance that appears to give superpowers to the teens exposed to it. Drake, Tristan, and
Irene are banking on a bid for freedom—but can they survive long enough to make it? 
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Hollander:

The book The Rig can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why must
we leave the best thing like a book The Rig? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one
aim that will book can give many data for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer together with
your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book The Rig has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can search the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Mary Perez:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name The Rig suitable to
you? Often the book was written by well known writer in this era. Typically the book untitled The Rigis the
one of several books that everyone read now. That book was inspired many people in the world. When you
read this book you will enter the new dimension that you ever know before. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to recognise the core of this e-book. This book
will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the
world on this book.

Allen Green:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic in
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Rig can be fine book to read. May be it could be best
activity to you.

Elda Baggett:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that.
What you must do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books.
Among the books in the top checklist in your reading list is usually The Rig. This book and that is qualified
as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and review this
guide you can get many advantages.
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