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Dead on Ice is the first installment of Lauren Carr’s new series (Lovers in Crime) featuring Hancock County
Prosecuting Attorney Joshua Thornton and Pennsylvania State Police homicide detective Cameron Gates.

Spunky Cameron Gates is tasked with solving the murder of Cherry Pickens, a legendary star of
pornographic films, whose body turns up in an abandoned freezer. The case has a personal connection to her
lover, Joshua Thornton, because the freezer was located in his cousin’s basement. It doesn’t take long for
their investigation to reveal that the risqué star’s roots were buried in their rural Ohio Valley community,
something that Cherry had kept off her show business bio. She should have kept her hometown off her road
map, too—because when this starlet came running home from the mob, it proved to be a fatal homecoming.
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From reader reviews:

Gussie Steller:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the headline Dead on Ice
(Lovers in Crime Mystery Book 1) suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in
this era. The book untitled Dead on Ice (Lovers in Crime Mystery Book 1)is a single of several books that
everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this
publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know previous to. The author explained their strategy
in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a
lot of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this particular
book.

Marni Elliott:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV,
or maybe playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read any book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you simply
read you can spent all day long to reading a e-book. The book Dead on Ice (Lovers in Crime Mystery Book
1) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-
book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but
this book provides high quality.

Leslie White:

The book untitled Dead on Ice (Lovers in Crime Mystery Book 1) contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the people, so
do certainly not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author
brings you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can keep reading your smart
phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book,
you can open up their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Rosemary Lilly:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. That Dead on Ice (Lovers in Crime Mystery Book 1)
can give you a lot of good friends because by you looking at this one book you have thing that they don't and
make you actually more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This reserve offer you information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than some
other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Dead on Ice (Lovers in Crime Mystery
Book 1).
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